PART-H—COBE-OF-ORDINANCES

Chapter6-BUILDINGS-AND-STRUCTURES

Chapter 6 BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES*! «—{ Formatted: bo

ARTICLE I. - IN GENERAL

ARTICLE Il - BUILDING CODE

ARTICLE Il]. - ELECTRICAL
ARTICLE IVH. - GAS

ARTICLE V. - HOUSING-PROPERTY MAINTENANCE

ARTICLE VI. - PLUMBING

ARTICLE VI]. - RESERVED-ENERGY CODE

ARTICLE VIII. - MECHANICAL CODE

ARTICLE IXVAH. - ONE-ANDPWO-FAMILY DWELLINGRESIDENTIAL CODE

ARTICLE #X. - UNIHFORM-CODE-FOR-BUILDING-CONSERVAHON-EXISTING BUILDING CODE

ARTICLE XI. - SWIMMING POOLS

Brenham,Texas, CodeofOrdinances———————— Page 1



ARTICLE I. IN GENERAL

Sec. 6-1. Adoption of building codes.

The codes listed below are—hereby—adepted—and all revisions thereto are hereby adopted and
incorporated as fully as if set forth at length herein, save and except such portions as may hereinafter be
amended, -ef-which-codeand not less than two (2) copies of sald codes have been and are now filed at
the offices of the City of Brenham-a i
herein, and from the date on which this section shall take effect the provisions thereln shall be controlllnq
in_the construction, alteration, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, and maintenance ;
removal-and-demelition-of all buildings and structures within the area of jurisdiction of the city.

Codes adopted by the City of Brenham:

2012 International Building Code (IBC) “[Formatted: Space After: 10 pt

2014 National Electric Code (NEC)

2012 International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC)

2012 International Mechanical Code (IMC)

2012 International Property Maintenance Code (IPMC)

2012 International Plumbing Code (IPC)

2012 International Energy Conservation Code (IECC)

2012 International Residential Code (IRC)

2012 International Existing Building Code (IEBC)

L

a Formatted: Font: Arial, 10 pt
Formatted: Normal, Indent: Left: 0"




“[Formatted: Left, Indent: Left:

0.3"




Sec. 6-2. Permits

(a)- Permits shall be issued for all work as required by the adopted codes.

(b)- The city council shall set, by resolution, fees for permits under this chapter at their sole discretion.

(c) Permits issued for lawful construction shall be null and void if such construction has been abandoned
for a period of 180 days.

Page 4



Comment [JF1]: Is this section correct? ]
isee' 6-6—Penaltiesforviolation-of build S, code- Formatted: Highlight ]

Page 5



See6-8

Sec. 6-213. Office of the Building Official i i Appointment;
qualifications: making required inspections and reports.

A qualified Building Official shall serve as chief eleetrical-combination inspector and any designated
assistants- combination inspectors shall be appointed by the city manager, subject to the approval of the
governing _body. Such inspector(s) shallmust be fully qualified from—aprofessional

intprofessionals; must be of good moral character and business integrity; and must maintain all
applicable mspeeter—mternanonal code counC|I mspector cert|f|cat|ons and Ilcenses as required by best
pracnces or state Iaw y

The Bundlnq Off|C|aI shaII be responnasible for |nterpretat|ons and enforcement of the adopted bunqu

codes.

(Ord-of4-22.47 §5 Art 1) <+ Formatted: po

Sec. 6-224.1. Same—Conflicting interests prohibited.

The Building Official and any designated combination inspectors i i durin
histhiertheir tenure of office shall not be engaged in the business of building, plumbing, electrical or any
other type of construction_contracting or any branch of the eleetricalconstruction business either directly
or indirectly or have such financial interest in such business within the city. It shall be prohibited for any
employee engaged in inspection activities to inspect his/her own work or any work performed by an entity
in which they have a financial interest.

Sec. 6-25. Board of appeals—Composition; appointment: qualifications.

The Building Standards Commission is hereby appointed the board of appeals for any appeal of a
decision by the Bwlqu Official or varlance requested from the adopted building codes -shall-consist-of

Page 6



Sec. 6-26. Same—Calling meetings.

The board of appeals shall meet at the call of the eity-managerBuilding Official -
(Ord. of 4-22-47, § 22, Art. 2)

Sec. 6-285.1. Appeals—To board of appeals; procedure; fee.

An ici i itpermit_holder, whose wiri i i work hashave been
disappreveddenied or rejected by the eleetrical inspector, and a controversy has arisen as to whether the
work conforms to the ordinances and regulations, or a person who has been ordered by the inspector to
incur an expense in the alteration, repair or construction of the-eleetrical-installation-ef-any building, may
within fifteen (15) days thereafter appeal therefrom by giving to the inspector notice in writing of such an
appeal; such notice or a certified copy thereof shall at once be transmitted by the inspector to the board of
appeals. After notice to such persons as the board may direct, a hearing shall be had, and the board may
by a majority vote affirm, annul or modify such action of the inspector. If the action of the inspector is
affirmed, such action shall have full force and effect. If the action of the inspector is modified or annulled a
permit shall be issued accordingly.

Sec. 6-295.2. Same—To governing body.

If an applicant isbe dissatisfied with the decision of the board of appeals he shall have the right of<—[ Formatted: p0

final appeal to_-the governing body, whose judgment as to all matters involved shall be final.

Sec. 6-306. Liability.

The prowsmns of this Chapter%ele shall not be construed to relleve from or to _lessen the

work within the scope of these adopted codes and—a—pemm{—for damaue or_injury to any person _or

Page 7



property, nor shall it be construed to impose on the city any liability by reason of the inspection herein
provided for or by reason of any certificate issued hereafter.

(Ord—0t4-22-47.53)

Sec. 6-337. Same—Exemption of owners doing own work.

Any person, who

has ac U|red the necessa ermlts from the BU|Id|n Off|<:|a| #em—ma erform work
on athier—own electrical-work—on—his—ewn—property or premises where the person hashey—-have a
homestead exemption, provided thepermit-is—paidforand obtained—and-that the material andand
equipment_used_and the work that is done_arebe in strict accord with the rules and requlations of this
article and that the eleetrical-inspector's approval be obtained upon inspection in reqular order. The
property owner must actually perform the work and no person other than the actual owner shall do any
part of the work unless the other person; is fully berded-and-licensed and in full compliance with all-ef the
provisions of this article.

Sec. 6-8. Keeping records.

The Building Official shall keep complete records of all permits issued and inspections made.;

Sec. 6-499. Request for final inspection; issuance and revocation of certificate;
temporary and preliminary certificates.

Upon the completion of the-installation-of the electric wiring.—devicesand-eguipmentall work which
haves been authorized by issuance of a permit, it shall be the duty of the person installing the same to

sepermit _holder to_notify the eleetrical-inspector, who shall inspect the installation promptly after such
notice is given; and, if it is found to be fully in compliance with the provisions of this aticlechapter, they
haII issue to such gerson a final certlflcate of aggroval authorizing eenneenen%em&eleetm—semee—theg

Meﬂ;aﬂen%ueh—uﬂhﬂ—as—#wbe—mm%e—deem@—semeeoccupancy of the bundlnq or

structure.. When a certificate is issued authorizing the eennection—and-use of temporary work, such
certificate shall be issued to expire at a stated time and shall be revocable by the eleetrical-inspector at
his_discretion. A preliminary certificate may be issued authorizing the—connection—and use of certain
specified portions of an uncompleted installationproject, which preliminary certificate shall be revocable at

the discretion of the eleetrical-inspector. No certificate of apprevaloccupancy shall be issued unless the
all work has been inspected and is—are in_strict

eleetm:—hght—aewer—ra&e—and—heaﬂne—mstaﬂaﬂens
conformity with the provisions of this articlechapter and the statutes of the state.

Sec. 6-509.1. Inspections prior to concealment.

When any part of a building system a-eleetrical-wiring-is to be hidden from view by the permanent
lacement of parts of the building, the person installing any concealed building systems iring shall so

Page 8



notify the-eleetrical inspector and such parts of the wiring-installation shall not be concealed until they

have been |nsnected or apDroved—er—umH—twenw-few—%—heuﬁ—éexelﬂswe—ew

(Ord-0f-4-22-47_8 8 At 3) “[ Formatted: p0

Sec. 6-519.2. Notice of defects.

If upon inspection-the—eleetrical- of any building system, the building system_is-net found to_not be
fully in compliance with this article, the eleetrical-inspector shall at once forward to the person installing
the wiring, a notice stating the defects which have been found to exist.

Sec. 6-529.3. Periodic re-inspections; correction of defective conditions.

Comment [L2]: Should electrical inspector be
changed to inspector? Seems this change was made
in other sections.

permltted work

and when me—ms{aua{m%ef—anv—suekkebemeaHMHne—daﬂees—and%epe%mmeMany permltted Work
completed has -isbeen found to be in a dangerous or unsafe condition, the persons owning, using, or
operating the same shall be so notified in writing by the inspector and shall make the necessary repairs or
change required to place such-wiring.devices—and-eguipment-for such work to be in a safe condition and

have such work completed within fifteen (15) days or any longer period specified by the—electrical
inspector _in_said notice. The electrical-inspector is hereby empowered to disconnect or order the
discontinuance of eleetrieutility services to such wiring.—devicesand/orequipmentstructure, building, or
systems_so found to be defectively or improperly constructed or installed until-the-installation-of such
wiring-devices-and-equipment-havework have been made safe as directed by himthe inspector.

{Ord-of4-22-47.§10) “[Formatted: Space After: 0 pt

Sec. 6-10. Tradesman—License required.

It shall be unlawful for any plumber, electrician, or mechanical installer to perform any work that
requires a permit within the city, without first obtaining a license from the State of Texas to engage in
electrical, plumbing, or mechanical work —and practice. Licensed tradesman must be the permit holders
for any work required to be completed by a licensed tradesman.

Sec. 6-8111. Conflict of code with other regulations.

(a) _The provisions of the plumbingbuilding —codes_shall supersede local laws, ordinances, codes or
regulations to the extent that such laws, ordinances, codes or regulations are inconsistent with the
provisions of said code; provided, that nothing herein contained shall be construed to prevent the
adoption and enforcement of a law, ordinance, or regulation which is more restrictive or establishes a
higher standard than those provided in the plumbing code, and such more restrictive requirement or
higher standard shall govern during the period in which it is in effect.

(b) In a case where a provision of the plumbingbuilding —codes are—is found to be in conflict with a
provision of a zoning, building, electrical, plumbing, fire, safety, health, water supply or sewage
disposal law or ordinance, or regulation adopted pursuant thereto, or other local law, ordinance, code
or_regulation, the provision or requirement which is more restrictive or establishes the higher
standard shall prevail.

Page 9



(Ord. of 7-10-72, § 3.00)

Sec. 6-812. Conformity with other regulations.

(a) Installations, alterations and repairs to_commercial or —residential premises. manufacturedebile
homes and-mobile-home-courts—and-materials, assemblies, and eguipment utilized in_connection

therewith, shall be reasonably safe to persons and property, and in _conformity with applicable

ordinances of the city and orders, rules and regulations issued by the authority thereof.

(b) Except as otherwise provided in this article, conformity of installations, alterations and repairs of
commercial or residential premises, ~mobilemanfuacturedmanufactured homes, -ceurtbuildings-and
thelraceessory structures —and-of materials, assemblies, and equipment utilized in connection with
such buildings and structures, with the applicable requirements of the building codes_adopted in
seetionCehapter 6-1, shall be prima facie evidence that such work, materials, assembly or equipment
is reasonably safe to persons and property.

Sec. 6-813. Severability of provisions of code.

It is hereby declared that the several provisions of the plumbingbuilding —codes are separable, in
accordance with the following:
1) If any court of competent jurisdiction shall judge any provisions thereof to be invalid, such
judgment shall not affect any other provisions thereof not specifically included in said judgment.
2) If any court of competent jurisdiction shall judge invalid the application of any provision thereof

to a particular property, building or other structure, such judgment shall not affect the application
of said provision to any other property, building or structure not specifically included in said
judgment.

Sec. 6-814. Penalties for violations of code.

Comment [L3]: Should this be changed to
misdemeanor_and upon conviction shall be punished as provided in section 1-5 of the_ City of “building codes”?

Brenham Code of Ordinances.

b) Any person who allows or permits the use or occupancy of any building, structure or premises of
which he is the owner,- thatwhich is in violation of any provision of the plumbingbuilding codes shall
be likewise punished.

(Ord. of 7-10-72, § 7.00)

Sec. 6-815. Relief.

It is not the intent of the plumbingbuilding codes to declare, and it does not so declare, anything to
be a nuisance which is not such in fact. Any person to whom any order is directed or against whose
property is taken or proposed to be taken under the terms and provisions of the plimbingbuilding -codes
shall have the right to appeal such order or action to any court having jurisdiction thereof.

(Ord. of 7-10-72, § 5.00)

Page 10



Secs. 6-16—6-25. Reserved.

ARTICLE Il. ELECTRICALBUILDING CODE

Page 11



Sec. 6-26. Adoption of building code.

The International Building Code, being particularly the 2012 International Building Code, and all
revisions thereto, save and except such portions as may hereinafter be amended, of which code not less
than two (2) copies have been and are now filed at the offices of the City of Brenham, are hereby adopted
and incorporated as fully as if set forth at length herein, and from the date on which this section shall take
effect, the provisions therein shall be controlling in the construction, alteration, repair, equipment, use and
occupancy, location, maintenance, removal and demolition of all buildings and structures within the area
of jurisdiction of the city.

Sec. 6-26.1. Building code local amendments.

The following local amendments are made to thelFfhe2012 International Building Code, 2012 Edition,

is-hereby amended-as followsas adopted by the City of Brenhamj] Comment [L4]: We need to cite the specific
. . . . ) . ions of the Building Code th bei
Section 101.1 is hereby amended by inserting the following: the City of Brenham :if;';’;‘:; he Bullding Code that are being

Section 1612.3 is hereby amended by inserting the following: City of Brenham

Section 1612.3 is hereby amended by inserting the following: "Flood Insurance Study for Washington
County, Texas and Incorporated Areas," dated August 16, 2011.”

Section 3412.2 is hereby amended by inserting the following: [Effective date of ordinance adopting

Building Code
Section 107 is hereby amended by adding Section 107.6 to read as follows:{a)Partt ‘—/[Comment [IF5]: This is IN ADDITION TO Section }
107 of IBC

Building Plans, Applications and Permits

An application for a building permit shall be accompanied by a minimum of two (2) copies of a site

plan and floor plan for all one-and two-family dwellings, commercial building and apartments five

thousand (5,000) square feet or less. Large commercial and apartment buildings over five thousand

(5,000) square feet, will require two (2) copies of a full set of plans, including plumbing, electrical,

mechanical, structural, final topography, MEP site plans, and all architectural and engineering seals

to accompany an application for a building permit. Utility requirements should be noted on all plans.

Site plan will show:

(1) Plan drawn to scale of not smaller than one” = 50" and labeled.

(2) Plan must show dimension of all property lines.

(3) All existing and proposed structures must be shown with building dimensions and distances
from property lines.

(4) Access must be shown with dimensions, shape and location.

(5) All recorded public easements shall be shown and properly dimensioned.

(6) Location and width of curbs, drainage ditches, sidewalks and right-of-ways.

(7) Parking areas must be carefully shown and dimensioned.

Page 12



(8) Proposed finished floor elevation and top of curb elevation shall be noted.

The floor plan shall include the proposed utility requirements for the structure. Plan review will be
completed within ten (10) working days after submission of plans on most applications. Larger
projects may take longer. After review, individual permits will be issued for building, electrical,
mechanical, plumbing, fire system and irrigation phases. Each individual contractor shall be
responsible for inspection of his work. All plumbing, mechanical, fire system and irrigation
contractors must show appropriate state license and proof of insurance. All electrical contractors
shall have a current state license and all employees must have proper journeyman or apprentice
license on job. All extensions, taps, permit fees or deposits shall be paid at the time the permit is
issued.

Prior to construction, the contractor or owner shall verify with the city all utility locations and depths.
The contractor shall be responsible for placing a string line on a minimum of two (2) property lines,
the front and one side. The building inspector may request string lines on additional property lines.
These string lines shall be in place at the time of the foundation inspection.

All alterations to building layout, electrical, mechanical, plumbing and structural must have amended
drawings and city approval prior to construction.

The property owner is responsible for location of property lines and underground utilities. Fences
shall not obstruct drainage or redirect drainage on adjacent property. Any fence along or across an
easement may be removed by utility personnel. The city is not required to reconstruct any fences
inside of utility easements.

All retainer wall construction requires written approval of the city prior to construction. All cut and/or
fill on an improved property requires written city approval prior to work.

A certificate of occupancy will be issued at the completion of all new construction by the city building
department. Permanent service will be connected upon issuance of the certificate of occupancy. No
occupancy of the building will be allowed prior to the issuance of the certificate of occupancy. No
exceptions will be made without written consent of the city building official.

Section 1507.8 is_hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows: [(6}-Wooden roof covering

materials are forbidden

Section 1507.9 is deleted in its entirety.

Section 2308.9. is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows: Walls and partitions shall be
constructed in accordance with the applicable provisions of Sections 2308.9.1 through 2308.9.4.2.
{e)-In walls containing Plumbing Drain, Waste & Vent lines all framing members shall be 2 inch by
six inch (2 x 6) or larger.

Comment [JF6]: Replaces Sections 1507.8 and
1507.9

/{ Comment [JF7]: In addition to Section 2308.9 ]

Section 2303.1.1 is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows: Sawn lumber used for load-
supporting purposes, including end-jointed or edge-glued lumber, machine stress-rated or machine-
evaluated lumber, shall be identified by the grade mark of a lumber grading or inspection agency
that has been approved by an accreditation body that complies with DOC PS 20 or equivalent.
Grading practices and identification shall comply with rules published by an agency approved in
accordance with the procedures of DOC PS 20 or equivalent procedures. fg)-Utility grade lumber
shall not be used for joists, rafters or vertical framing. |

/{ Comment [JF8]: In addition to IBC 2303.1.1 ]

Kg)-If work done on a building/structure cumulatively within any 12-month period constitutes a

"substantial improvement" (as defined in the City's flood damage prevention ordinances, e.g.,
Section 8 % -5 of this Code), the owner shall—to the extent reasonably practicable—make the

Page 13

/{ Comment [JF9]: In addition to IBC 1612.3 ]




building comply with current code provisions for new construction regarding: (i) structural
components (except foundations) and (ii) life safety features (hand and guard rails, smoke alarms,
carbon monoxide alarms, safety glazing, ground fault circuit interrupters, arc-fault combination
breakers, emergency egress from sleeping rooms, locking devices on required egress components,
etc.). To determine the "market value" of a pre-existing building, the most current tabulation of
square foot construction costs published by the International Code Council (usually as part of

"Building Valuation Data.” see e.q., www.iccsafe.org/cs/techservices) shall be used. | /[cOmment [IF10]: In addition to Section 105

Section 105 is hereby amended by adding Section 105.9 to read as follows: [(h}-If a building is
"substantially damaged" (as defined in the City's flood damage prevention ordinances, e.g., Section
8 % -5 of this Code), the owner shall cause it to be: (i) secured to prevent entry by unauthorized
persons, within 24 hours after all embers are extinguished (or other damaging occurrence has
ended) and (ii) either demolished (in accordance with Chapter 8 %2 of this Code) or rebuilt in
conformity with applicable technical codes as though it were a new building. Normal permits
(including certificate of occupancy) are required. Work to demolish or rebuild must begin within 60
days following the date the occurrence ends and must be completed within a reasonable time, but
not longer than the time allowed by the applicable permit(s). To determine the "market value" of a
pre-existing building, the most current tabulation of square foot construction costs published by the
International Code Council (usually as part of "Building Valuation Data," see, e.g.,

www.iccsafe.org/cs/techservices) shall be used.| /{ Comment [JF11]: In addition to 105

()Section 110.3.1 is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows: Footing and foundation
inspections shall be made after excavations for footings are complete and any required reinforcing
steel is in place. For concrete foundations, any required forms shall be in place prior to inspection.
Materials for the foundation shall be on the job, except where concrete is ready mixed in accordance
with ASTM C 94, the concrete need not be on the job. Form Surveys performed by a Texas
Registered Professional Licensed Surveyor are required to be submitted prior to approval of

foundation inspection. Comment [JF12]: In addition to IBC 110.3.1
(foundations) and IBC 110.3.2 (slabs)

Section 110.3.2 is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows: Concrete slab and under-floor
inspections shall be made after in-slab or under-floor reinforcing steel and building service
equipment, conduit, piping accessories and other ancillary equipment items are in place, but before
any concrete is placed or floor sheathing installed, including the subfloor. Form Surveys performed
by a Texas Registered Professional Licensed Surveyor are required to be submitted prior to
approval of foundation inspection.

Secs. 6-27—6-29. Reserved.

Page 14



the NEC 2014 — but it hasn’t come in yet — can we

IARTICLE Ill ELECTRIC CODE

{Comment [JF13]: We've ordered our copy of

add these btwn. 1% and 2™ reading?
Comment [L14]: Yes, we can add the specific

section provisions between 1% and 2" reading.

Sec. 6-31. Adoption of National Electric Code (NEC) 2014 Edition.

The National Electric Code, being particularly the 2014 National Electric Code, and all revisions
thereto, save and except such portions as may hereinafter be amended, of which code not less than two
(2) copies have been and are now filed at the offices of the City of Brenham, are hereby adopted and
incorporated as fully as if set forth at length herein, and from the date on which this section shall take
effect, the provisions therein shall be controlling in the construction, alteration, repair, equipment, use and
occupancy, location, maintenance, removal and demolition of all buildings and structures within the area

of jurisdiction of the city.] Comment [L15]: Is this the correct description
of the ElectricCode?

Sec. 6-30.1. Amendments-to-Electrical- CodeElectrical Code local amendments.

The following local amendments are made to the National Electric Code, 2014 Edition, as adopted /[Formatted: Font: Italic

by the City of Brenham i

Comment [L16]: We need to cite the specific
sections of the Electric Code that are being
amended.

(a) Certain circuits, plugs required.

Window air conditioners. All window air conditioning units, whether to be operated on 110vac or
220vac current, shall be installed with and bonded to a polarized plug, and Number 10 AWG wire
minimum for 220vac shall be used in bonding said air conditioning unit to the said polarized plug.

(b) Meters.

(1) Tiers. On apartment buildings, where space limitations will not permit placing all meters at
the same height, they may be arranged in two tiers, with the openings for the meter dials in lower tier
as near as practicable to five feet above mean ground level and second tier placed as near as
practicable above the first. Where space limitations will not permit placing of meter cabinets as
outlined above, the electric public service company, subject to the approval of the building official,
may determine the arrangement to be used. All service outlets shall be located so as to permit
placing the electric public service company's service wires on the wall of the building next to the
supply.

(2) Street side meters. The electric public service company shall never require the placing of the
meter on the front or street side of a building, without the written consent of the owner, and where
not practical in the opinion of the building official to place metering devices on the exterior of the
building, said location shall be at a point, or points, convenient to the electric public service
company's service as determined by the building official.

(c) Minimum size of service conduit.

Page 15



Service conduit for any occupancy shall not be smaller than 1.25 inches, unless specifically
approved otherwise by the building official.

(d) Distribution system limitation.

For the purpose of this article, the distribution system of any person furnishing electric power shall
not extend to any property which such person does not own in fee simple or control by easement.

(e) Tampering with fuses, circuit breakers.

It shall be unlawful for any person:

Q) To bridge, tamper with or change from its original installation (except upon the approval of
the building official, and then only after a proper permit for alteration has been issued) any fuse of
the plug, cartridge type or link type installed in panel boards, main switches or switchboards;

(2) To alter or change circuit breakers so that the original calibration will be affected; or

3) To tie down or secure any circuit breaker so that it will not function properly.

(f) Outside switches.

Switches and equipment installed on the outside of the building in a recess in the outside wall and
covered by a door as part of the building structure shall be considered as being on the exterior of the
building and exposed to the weather.

(g) Service entrance conductors.

In any residence, apartment, apartment house, commercial building or other building of whatsoever
character now existing or to be constructed within the city, all service entrance conductors, including
underground conductors, shall have a minimum current-carrying capacity of 150 amperes. On
buildings with existing service, this requirement shall apply when:

(1 Load is added or modified;

(2) An existing service is found to be inadequate for demand; or

3) An unsafe condition exists.

(4) When replacing main service panel, all-service disconnect, service riser, or service
underground lateral.

Page 16



Exception: Existing dwellings with a framed area of less than 1,500 square feet may have
conductors with a minimum current-carrying capacity of 125 amperes.

(h) All-service disconnect.

In every building now existing or to be constructed within the city, there must be an "all-service
disconnect" accessible on the outside of the building and located as close as practicable to the
meter. It shall consist of one switch or circuit breaker having a continuous current rating of no less
than 150 amperes. On buildings with existing service, this requirement shall apply when load is
added or modified or whenever an unsafe condition exists or when replacing main service panel, all-
service disconnect, service riser or service underground lateral. Exception: Existing dwellings with a
framed area of less than 1,500 square feet may have a main "all-service disconnect" with a minimum
continuous current rating of 125 amperes.

(i) Wires, cables, conductors and circuits.

1) Wires, cables and conductors. Notwithstanding any other code provision or ordinance to the
contrary, it shall be unlawful for any person to install or use any of the following in connection with
electrical work for any structure in the city:

(A) Any wire other than solid or stranded copper;

(B) Any wire smaller than gauge 12 AWG;

(Q) Any wire without a separate ground, either in the same cable or in the same conduit;

(D) Armored cable, type A/C;

(E) MC cable, unless the exterior armor is color-coded its entire length by the manufacturer to
distinguish it from other flexible metallic conduit systems;

(B Nonmetallic sheathed cables, as listed in article 334 of the NEC, but this prohibition only
applies to multifamily dwellings with more than one floor above grade; or

(G) Nonmetallic sheathed cables, as listed in article 334 of the NEC, except in buildings used
and occupied exclusively for residential purposes (without any nonresidential occupancies or mixed
uses, even if only accessory or incidental).

(2) Circuits. Notwithstanding any other code provision or ordinance to the contrary, it shall be
unlawful for any person to install or use more than ten openings (outlets or fixtures) on any single
electrical circuit for any structure in the city.

Page 17



()] Old work. In any proceeding to enforce this section with respect to:

(1) wire smaller than gauge 12 AWG; or

(2) wire lacking a separate ground; or

(3) having more than ten openings on a single circuit;

(k) Grounding, GFCls, etc.

(1) Supplemental grounding. On any new service or change-out service there must be a
supplemental grounding electrode as specified in article 250.52(A) of the NEC, with the grounding
electrode conductor sized per table 250.66 of the NEC.

(2) Certain GFCls. The ground-fault circuit-interrupter required for a hydro-massage shall not be
located under such a bathtub and must be readily accessible.

Page 18



(Ord—0f4-22-47 8§ 5 Art3) 4—[ Formatted: po

Sec. 6-2332. Same—Right of entry and disconnection of service.

The eleetrical-Building Officialinspeetor or his duly authorized assistant shall have the right to enter
any building during reasonable hours in the discharge of his official duties and shall have the authority to
cause the disconnection of any wiring or equipment, which such wiring or equipment in his judgment is
dangerous to life or property, or may interfere with the work of the fire department.

Page 19



Page 20



Page 21



Page 22



Sec. 6-4233. Adeption-ofcode-and-mMeter loop specifications.

The National Electrical Code, being particularly the 2665-2014 National Electrical Code, save and
except such portions as may hereinafter be amended and the meter loop specifications of the Municipal
Light and Power System of the City of Brenham, Texas, are hereby adopted and incorporated as fully as
if set forth at length herein, and from the date on which this section shall take effect, the provisions therein
shall be controlling for all electrical work within the area of jurisdiction of the city. Not less than two (2)
copies of said National Electrical Code, and meter loop specifications of the Municipal Light and Power
System of the city, shall be filed in the office of the electrical-inspecterBuilding Official of the city.

Ord-—of 4 47 5 19: Ord-o 0- 88 700 900 Ord-o 0 88 700900 Ord-o
- 3 3 - 3 AR g 3 FIU9 99, g

Sec. 6-4334. Modifications of code or meter loop specifications.

Any requirement deemed by the inspector necessary for safeguarding the hazards from fire and to
life in connection with any electrical installation not specially covered by this article shall be determined by
the inspector, subject to appeal to the board of appeals in the manner prescribed in section 6-285.1.

Page 23



{Ord—oF4-22-47-5-2)

Sec. 6-4#35. Approved materials, devices, appliances, apparatus.

It shall be unlawful to manufacture, sell or use any electrical materials, devices, appliances or
apparatus which are not approved by the Underwriters' Laboratories, Inc., Chicago, lllinois, anywhere or
anytime within the city.

{Ord—of-4-22-47-89)

Sec. 6-4836. Allowing use of or furnishing electric current without inspection and
certificate of approval prohibited.

In order to protect the lives of the citizens and the property of the citizens from the dangers incident
to defective wiring of buildings and structures, it shall be unlawful for any person to allow any electrical
current used for the purpose of producing light, heat or power in buildings or structures belonging to such
person, to be turned on without first having had an inspection made of the wiring by the electrical
inspector and having received from the inspector a certificate of occupancy approving the wiring of such
building, unless otherwise provided in this article.

It shall be unlawful for any person engaged in the business of selling electricity to furnish any
electrical current for use for light, heat or power purposes in any building or structure of any person,
unless the building or structure has first been inspected by the electrical-inspector er-his-assistant-and a
certificate of occupancy given as hereinafter provided, unless otherwise authorized in this article.

Page 24



Sec. 6-5337. Re-inspection and correction in certain knob and tube systems; protection
of exterior switches and fuse cabinets.

Whenever the service wires of a so-called knob and tube system are disconnected or electrical
services disconnected to and in any commercial building or any building in the first fire district which has
been vacated for any period in excess of thirty (30) days, the service shall not again be connected until
same has been wired so as to conform to this article, subject to any special conditions as approved by the
electrical inspector.

All switches or fuse cabinets mounted on the exterior of any buildings must be of an approved
weatherproof type.

(Ord-of4-22-47.517)
Sec. 6-5438. Advertising on light and telephone poles and wires; wires under sheds, etc.

(a) It shall be unlawful for any person to place or allow to be placed any advertising cards or posters or
other light material on any electric, telephone or telegraph poles within the city.

Page 25



Sec. 6-5539. Electric policy and construction standards.

(a) Adopted. The following electric policy and construction standards areis hereby adopted by reference
as though theyit were copied herein fully; Electric Policy and Construction Standards of the City of
Brenham, Texas.

(b) Copy on file. An official copy of the Electric Policy and Construction Standards of the City of
Brenham, Texas, shall be kept on file in the office of the city secretary, which shall be available for
the public to review.

(c) Contrary provisions. Any matters in the Electric Policy and Construction Standards of the City of
Brenham, Texas, which are contrary to existing ordinances of the city shall prevail, and, to that
extent, any existing ordinances to the contrary are hereby repealed in that respect only.

(d) Duities of officials. Within said electric policy and construction standards of the city, when reference is
made to the duties of certain officials named therein, the designated official in the City of Brenham
who has duties corresponding to those of the named official shall act insofar as the enforcement of
the provisions of said policy and standards are concerned.

Secs. 6-40—6-49. Reserved.

Page 26



ARTICLE KV} GAS

Sec. 6-6050. Adoption of code.

The International Fuel and Gas Code, being particularly the 2003-2012 International Fuel Gas Code
(IEGC), save and except such portions as may hereinafter be amended, of which not less than two (2)
copies have been made and are now filed in the offices of the public-weorks-departmentCity of Brenham,
are hereby adopted and incorporated as fully as if set forth at length herein, and from the date on which
this section shall take effect, the provisions therein shall be controlling in the installation, alteration, and
maintenance of all gas piping systems within the area of jurisdiction of the city.

Sec. 6-6050.1. Gas code_local amendments.

The following local amendments are made to the nternatlonal Fuel and Gas Code 2012 Edition, as Formatted: Font: Italic ]
adopted by the City of Brenham:Fhe
fellows: ‘ Comment [L17]: We need to cite the specific

sections of the Fuel and Gas Code that are being

Section 101.1 is hereby amended by inserting: the City of Brenham amended.

R Formatted

: Font: 10 pt

Section 106.6 is deleted in its entirety.

Formatted:

No bullets or numbering

Font: 10 pt

Space Before: 0 pt, No bullets or

provision of this code, fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or erect, install, alter or repair

Formatted:

No bullets or numbering

work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a permit or

Formatted:

certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine

of not more than two thousand dollars ($2,000.00). Each day that a violation occurs shall be deemed a numbering

Formatted:

Space Before: 0 pt, No bullets or

separate offense.

Formatted:

No bullets or numbering

Formatted
A

: Font: 10 pt

Section 108.5 is hereby by amended in its entirety to read as follows: Upon notice from the code

numbering

Formatted:

Space Before: 0 pt, No bullets or

official that work is being done contrary to the provisions of this code or in a dangerous or unsafe manner,

Formatted:

Formatted:
A
- . - . . Formatted:
Section 108.4 is hereby by amended in its entirety to read as follows: Persons who shall violate a \numbe,ng

)
)
)
J
)
Font: 10 pt ]
J
)
)
}
)

No bullets or numbering




such work shall immediately cease. Such notice shall be in writing and shall be given to the owner of the
property, the owner’s agent, or the person doing the work. The notice shall state the conditions under
which work is authorized to resume. Where an emergency exists, the code official shall not be required to

give a written notice prior to stopping the work.

Formatted: Font: 10 pt ]
Section 108.7 is hereby by amended in its entirety to read as follows: The code official shall have ES;’E:EZ& Space Before: 0 pt, No bullets or J
the authority to require disconnection of utility service to the building, structure or system regulated by the Formatted: No bullets or numbering ]
technical codes in case of emergency where necessary to eliminate an immediate hazard to life or
property. The code official shall notify the serving utility, and wherever possible, the owner and occupant
of the building, structure or service system of the decisions to disconnect prior to taking such action. If not
notified prior to disconnection, the owner or occupant of the building, structure or service system shall be
notified in writing, as soon as practicable thereafter.
Section 108.7.1 is hereby by amended in its entirety to read as follows: A person shall not make Formatted: Font: 10 pt J
energy source connections to installations requlated by this code which have been disconnected or Fo"Eat_tedi Space Before: 0pt, No bullets or J
numbpering

ordered to be disconnected by the code official, or the use of which has been ordered to be discontinued
by the code official until the code official authorizes the reconnection and use of such installations. When
an installation is maintained in violation of this code, the code official shall institute appropriate action to

prevent, restrain, correct or abate the violation.

«—/*{ Formatted:

No bullets or numbering

Section 108.7.2 is deleted in its entirety. Formatted: Font: 10 pt
Formatted: Space Before: 0 pt, No bullets or
numbering
Section 108.7.3 is deleted in its entirety. Formatted: No bullets or numbering
Formatted: Font: 10 pt
Section 403 is hereby amended by adding Section 403.14 to read as follows: Formatted: Space Before: 0 pt, No bullets or
numbering
a)-Even if otherwise permitted by this code] h :
- - . 3 - Formatted: No bullets or numbering
1. Copper, brass or aluminum tubing or piping shall not be used in the City.
. ] . Formatted: Font: 10 pt
2. Thermo plastic pipe may be used for gas lines only if it: (i) meets ASTM D2513 Formatted: Space Before: 0 pt. No bullets or
(or equivalent, or better), (ii) is identified by proper markings and (iii) is installed numbering
with a locator wire (No. 14 gauge copper wire). Comment [JF18]: IFGC 403 — addition to
3. Thermo plastic pipe shall terminate above ground outside of buildings and be Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 10 pt
installed in pre-manufactured anodeless risers or service head adapter risers, all Formatted: Font: 10 pt
in accordance with the manufacturer's installation instructions. Formatted: No bullets or numbering

Formatted:

1——Section{b)}Amend-Section 1406.4, to-read-in-its-entirety as followsis hereby amended in its entirety

between paragraphs of the same style, No
bullets or numbering

Space Before: 2.4 pt, Add space

to read as follows: “Low pressure (not to exceed 0.5 PSI) gas piping shall withstand a pressure of at least

Comment [JF19]: Replaces

10 inches of mercury on a manometer for a period of time not less than 10 minutes without showing any Formatted:

Font: 10 pt

drop in pressure, except that the following shall apply in the case of new construction: The newly- Formatted:

constructed system must withstand a pressure of at least 25 PSI, spring gage here is acceptable, for a

the same style, No bullets or numbering

Add space between paragraphs of

Formatted:

Font: (Default) Arial, 10 pt

period of not less than 10 minutes without showing any drop in pressure as an initial pressure test, i.e.

%

Formatted:

o 0 JC 0 A G U 0 U . UL

Font: 10 pt

Page 28



rough-in, and the system must also withstand a pressure test of 10 inches of mercury on a manometer

gage as a final test. Higher pressure piping systems must withstand pressure of at least 10 PSI, but never
less than twice the maximum pressure to which the piping will be subjected in operation, for a period of at

least 10 minutes without showing a drop in pressure. The manometer under test conditions shall not be

pressured more than 50% of the gage maximum pressure, i.e. a 10 psi test would require a 20 psi
manometer gage.

Formatted: Space Before: 2.4 pt, Add space
between paragraphs of the same style, No

22— Section 306.3 is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows: fe} There must be a bullets or numbering

permanently-installed stairway, either fixed or folding, to serve attic space where appliances or equipment Formatted: Font: 10 pt

are located. The opening must be at least 25.5" x 54", and any folding staircase must be rated for at least Formatted: Add space between paragraphs of
. . ) . the same style, No bullets or numbering

350 pounds capacity and at least 20 minutes fire resistance and large enough to remove the largest

appliance installed there in] /{Comment [JF20]: IFGC 306.3 - replaces
Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 10 pt
Formatted: Font: 10 pt

Section 402 is hereby amended by adding Section 402.7 to read as follows: -Each new or \Fgfvﬂzﬁtﬁgﬁa?:;ﬁfgfm sz;:ep;’ty/?g,d :l;())ace

bullets or numbering

Formatted: Font: 10 pt

Formatted: Add space between paragraphs of
the same style, No bullets or numbering

Comment [JF21]: IFGC 402 — in addition to

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 10 pt

Formatted: Font: 10 pt

Page 29



Sec. 6-6551. Cut-off valve.

(a) All gas service lines on the customer's property will be required to be equipped, ahead of the gas
meter assembly, with an approved type, flat ahead-lock pattern, cut-off valve to permit sealing of the
valve by authorized city personnel in order to prevent any flow of gas or prevent opening of said
valve by persons other than authorized city personnel.

(b) All gas piping on customer's premises where installed for connection of a range; water heater; space
heater; and the like; will be required to be provided with an approved type cut-off valve, installed in
the line and directly ahead of the above referred to appliances.

Page 30



Secs. 6-52—6-55. Reserved.

Page 31



PART Il - CODE OF ORDINANCES
Chapter 6 - BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES

ARTICLE IV. HOUSING

ARTICLE V. HOUSINGINTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE
Sec. 6-70. Code adopted.

Sec. 6-71. Severability of provisions of code.

Sec. 6-72. Penalty for violating code.
Secs. 6-73—6-79. Reserved.

Sec. 6-7056. Adoption of Code-adepted.

The International Property Maintenance Code, being particularly the 2012 International Property
Maintenance Code (IPMC), save and except such portions as may hereinafter be amended, of which not
less than two (2) copies have been made and are now filed in the offices of the City of Brenham, are
hereby adopted and incorporated as fully as if set forth at length herein, and from the date on which this
section shall take effect, the provisions therein shall be controlling within the area of jurisdiction of the city.

Sec. 6-56.1. Property Maintenance code local amendments.

The following local amendments are made to the International Property Maintenance Code, 2012

Edition, as adopted b‘v the City of Brenham:
amended-as follows:

Section 101.1 is hereby amended by inserting: the City of Brenham

Section 103.5 is deleted in its entirety.

Section 108 is deleted in its entirety.

Section 110 is deleted in its entirety.

Section 111 is deleted in its entirety.

Section 112.4 is deleted in its entirety.

Brenham, Texas, Code of Ordinances Page 32

Comment [JF22]: Need to delete the junk
vehicles sections and the Building Standards
Commission sections. | don’t have a copy of that
code!




PART Il - CODE OF ORDINANCES
Chapter 6 - BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES

ARTICLE IV. HOUSING

Section 302.4 is hereby amended by inserting: twelve (12) inches

Section 302.8 is deleted in its entirety.

Section 304.14 is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows: Every door, window and other outside
opening required for ventilation of habitable rooms, food preparation areas, food service areas or any

areas where products to be included or utilized in food for human consumption are processed,

manufactured, packaged or stored shall be supplied with approved tightly fitting screens of minimum 16
mesh per inch (16 mesh per 25 mm), and every screen door used for insect control shall have a self-

closing device in good working condition. Exception: Screens shall not be required where other approved

means, such as air curtains or insect repellent fans, are employed.

Section 602.3 is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows: Every owner and operator of any

building who rents, leases or lets one or more dwelling units or sleeping units on terms, either expressed
or implied, to furnish heat to the occupants thereof shall supply heat to maintain a minimum temperature

of 68°F (20°C) in all habitable rooms, bathrooms and toilet rooms. Exceptions: 1) When the outdoor

temperature is below the winter outdoor design temperature for the locality, maintenance of the minimum
room temperature shall not be required provided that the heating system is operating at its full design

capacity. The winter outdoor design temperature for the locality shall be as indicated in Appendix D of the
International Plumbing Code; and 2) In areas where the average monthly temperature is above 30°F (-
1°C) a minimum temperature of 65°F (18°C) shall be maintained.

Section 602.4 is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows: Indoor occupiable work spaces shall
be supplied with heat to maintain a minimum temperature of 65°F (18°C) during the period the spaces are

occupied. Exceptions: 1) Processing, storage and operation areas that require cooling or special
temperature conditions; and 2) Areas in which persons are primarily engaged in vigorous physical

activities.

Brenham, Texas, Code of Ordinances Page 33



Secs. 6-57—6-60. Reserved.

Page 34




ARTICLE VI. PLUMBING

Sec. 6-8061. Adoption of code.

The International Plumbing Code, being particularly the 200123 International Plumbing Code_(IPC),
and all revisions thereto, save and except such portions as may hereinafter be amended, of which not
less than two (2) copies have been and are now filed in the offices of the public-works-departmenCity of
Brenhamt, are hereby adopted and incorporated as fully as if set forth at length herein, and from the date
on which this section shall take effect, the provisions therein shall be controlling in the construction,
installation, extension, or repair of all plumbing, plumbing fixtures and plumbing systems within the area
of jurisdiction of the city.

Sec. 6-8061.1. Plumbing code local amendments.

The following local amendments are made to the International Plumbing Code, 2012 Edition, as
adopted by the City of Brenham: j P j j
follows:

Section 101.1 is hereby amended by inserting: the City of Brenham

Section 106.6.2 is deleted in its entirety.

Section 106.6.3 is deleted in its entirety.

Section 108.4 is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows: Any person who shall violate a

provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install,

alter or repair plumbing work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the code
official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a

Page 35



misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not more than two thousand dollars ($2000.00). Each day that a

violation continues shall be deemed a separate offense.

Section 108.5 is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows: Upon notice from the code official,

work on any plumbing system that is being done contrary to the provisions of this code or in a dangerous
or unsafe manner shall immediately cease. Such notice shall be in writing and shall be given to the owner

of the property, or to the owner’s agent, or to the person doing the work. The notice shall state the
conditions under which work is authorized to resume. Where an emergency exists, the code official shall
not be required to give a written notice prior to stopping the work.

Section 605 is hereby amended by adding Section 605.26 to read as follows:

Kg)—Even if otherwise permitted by the IPC3 /{Comment [JF23]: IPC 605 - in addition to

1 Acrylonitrile-Butadiene-Styrene (ABS) pipe and fittings, Type M copper, lead- based pipe, aluminum

DWYV pipe and components are not approved materials for use.

Section 918 is hereby amended by adding 918.9 to read as follows: 2-Air admittance valves are only

approved for use in an unenclosed structure, i. e. outdoor kitchen. | /{Comme”t [JF24]: IPC 918 —in addition to

3.Section 604.1 is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows: The design of the water distribution
system shall conform to accepted engineering practice. Methods utilized to determine pipe sizes shall be
approved. Any manifold system shall not be located on a wall shared with a garage

. Comment [JF25]: IPC 604.1 - in addition t
unless it does not penetrate the garage wall. | /{ [ ] in addition to

Section 605 is hereby amended by adding Section 605.26 to read as follows:

ib)-Even if otherwise permitted by the IPC] /{Commem [JF26]: IPC 605 — in addition to

1. 3 —PVC type water pipe and fittings are not allowed for use in the City. Exceptions: (A)
Schedule 40 meeting ASTM D1785 (or better) PVC water pipe may be used where permitted by
the IPC, but only if: (i) it is installed underground (but see paragraph “b” requiring selected

material in some locations) or as pool piping, (ii) all joints are primed and glued as required by the
manufacturer's recommendations (and the primer must be purple or another distinctive color,

except on above-ground pool piping), and (iii) it is identified by proper markings. (B) This section

does not apply to irrigation systems.
2. 2——All water lines under a slab on grade must be copper Type L, K or PEX, no joints. Each

water line under, in or through a slab on grade must be sleeved with a continuous piece of tubing

at least 0.025 inches thick terminating at least six inches above the finished floor.
3. 3——lrrigation systems must meet these criteria: (i) Schedule 40 PVC material meeting ASTM
D1785 (or better) must be used for pressure lines, i.e. up tp the valves. (ii) Class 160 PVC

Page 36



material (or better) must be used for field lines. (iii) All lines shall be buried at least six inches

below grade. Note: The City is not responsible for irrigation system components located in street

areas or easements (and special permits may be required to install such components in those

locations.

4. 4——Underground water service piping must be buried at least 12 inches below grade.

5. 5—PVC drain, waste or vent pipe and fittings must be Schedule 40 meeting ASTM D2665
(or better) and identified by proper markings. Exception; Area drain piping may be SDR 35 PVC.

{e)-Amend-Section 916.3 is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows: “The vent located below the /{Comment [IF27]: replaces
flood level rim of the fixture being vented shall be installed below the floor using drainage pattern fittings

with a fall of not less than one-quarter inch (1/4") per foot to the drain. The vent shall be sized in

accordance with Section 906.2 with 2 "diameter pipe being the minimum. The lowest point of the island

fixture vent shall connect full size to the drainage system. The vent or branch vent shall extend as high as
practicable, but not below the drain board. There shall be a vent loop at the top of the fixture riser. The
fittings shall prevent a horizontal segment at the top of the loop. Cleanouts shall be provided in the island

fixture drain and vent to permit rodding of all piping located below the flood level rim of the fixtures.
Rodding in both directions shall be permitted through a clean out.®

{d)}-Amend-Section [1101.2 ko read-in-its-entirety-as followsis hereby amended in its entirety to read as /{Comment [JF28]: replaces
follows: “The provisions of this chapter are applicable to interior leaders, building storm drains, building
storm sewers, exterior conductors, downspouts, roof gutters and other storm drainage fixtures and

facilities.®

Section 603.1 is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows: The water service pipe shall be sized
to supply water to the structure in the quantities and at the pressures required in this code. The water
service pipe shall be not less than 3/4 inch (19.1 mm) in diameter.fe} Maximum water meter size, unless
an Registered Professional Engineer can clearly and convincingly demonstrate the need for a larger

meter in a particular case, is: 1-inch for an irrigation system, or 1-inch for a single-family dwelling /{Comme“t [JF29]: IPC 603.1 - in addition to

(1) Contractors must register state license with the city prior to issuance of permit.

Page 37



3 ; - 7 H‘i Formatted: listl

Sec. 6-80:62. Cross-connection control program.

@

(b)

General. No water service connection shall be made to any establishment where a potential or actual
contamination hazard exists unless the water supply is protected in accordance with the Texas
Commission on Environmental Quality (TCEQ) Rules and Regulations for Public Water Systems
(290 Rules) and this section. The water purveyor shall discontinue water service if a required
backflow prevention assembly is not installed, maintained and tested in accordance with the 290
Rules and this section.

Backflow prevention assembly installation, testing and maintenance.

(1) All backflow prevention assemblies shall be tested upon installation by a licensed backflow
prevention assembly tester and certified to be operating within specifications. Backflow
prevention assemblies which are installed to provide protection against health hazards must
also be tested and certified to be operating within specifications at least annually by a
recognized backflow prevention assembly tester.

(2) All backflow prevention assemblies shall be installed and tested in accordance with the
manufacturer's instructions, the American Water Works Association's Recommended Practice
for Backflow Prevention and Cross-Connection Control (Manual M14) or the University of
Southern California Manual of Cross-Connection Control.

(3) Assemblies shall be repaired, overhauled, or replaced at the expense of the customer whenever
said assemblies are found to be defective. Original forms of such test, repairs, and overhaul
shall be kept and submitted to the city within five (5) working days of the test, repair or overhaul
of each backflow prevention assembly.

(4) No backflow prevention assembly or device shall be removed from use, relocated, or other
assembly or device substituted without the approval of the city. Whenever the existing assembly
or device is moved from the present location or can not be repaired, the backflow assembly or
device shall be replaced with a backflow prevention assembly or device that complies with this
section, the American Water Works Association's Recommended Practice for Backflow
Prevention and Cross-Connection Control (Manual M14), current addition, University of
Southern California Manual of Cross-Connection Control, current addition, or the current
plumbing code of the city, whichever is more stringent.

(5) Test gauges used for backflow prevention assembly testing shall be tested for accuracy at least
annually in accordance with the American Water Works Association's Recommended Practice
for Backflow Prevention and Cross-Connection Control (Manual M14), current addition, or the
University of Southern California's Manual of Cross-Connection Control, current addition. The
original calibration form must be submitted to the city within five (5) working days after
calibration.

Page 38



(6) A recognized backflow prevention assembly tester must hold a current endorsement from the
Texas Natural Resource Conservation Commission (Commission).

(c) Customer service inspections.

(1) A customer service inspection shall be completed prior to providing continuous water service to
all new construction, on any existing service when the water purveyor has reason to believe that
cross-connections or other contaminant hazards exist, or after any material improvement,
correction, or addition to the private water distribution facilities.

(2) Only individuals with the following credentials shall be recognized as capable of conducting a
customer service inspection:

a. Plumbing inspectors and water supply protection specialists that have been licensed by the
Texas State Board of Plumbing Examiners.

b. Customer service inspectors that have been licensed by the Texas Commission on
Environmental Quality (TCEQ).

(3) The customer service inspection must certify that:

a. No direct connection between the public drinking water supply and a potential source of
contamination is permitted. Potential sources of contamination shall be isolated from the
public water system by a properly installed air gap or an appropriate backflow prevention
assembly.

b. No cross-connection between the public water supply and a private water source exists.
Where an actual properly installed air gap is not maintained between the public water
supply and a private water supply, an approved reduced pressure-zone backflow
prevention assembly is properly installed and a service agreement exists for annual
inspection and testing by a recognized backflow prevention assembly tester.

c. No connection exists which allows water to be returned to the public drinking water supply
is permitted.

d. No pipe or pipe fitting which contains more than eight (8) per cent lead may be used for the
installation or repair of plumbing at any connection that provides water for human use.

e. No solder or flux which contains more than 0.2 per cent lead can be used for the
installation or repair of plumbing at any connection that provides water for human use. A
minimum of one (1) lead test shall be performed for each inspection.

(Ord. 0f 9-19-02, § 1)

Crossreference— Health-and-sanitation,-Ch-12:-utilities Ch-26-

Page 39



Page 40



S Secs. 6-63—6-65. Reserved.

Page 41



DronbartomsCodealOrdinanees Page 42



ARTICLE VI]. RESERVED-ENERGY CODE "

Sec. 6-66. Adoption of code.

The International Energy Conservation Code, being particularly the 2012 International Energy
Conservation Code (IECC), and all revisions thereto, save and except such portions as may hereinafter
be amended, of which not less than two (2) copies have been and are now filed in the offices of the City
of Brenham, are hereby adopted and incorporated as fully as if set forth at length herein, and from the
date on which this section shall take effect, the provisions therein shall be controlling within the area of
jurisdiction of the city.

Sec. 6-66.1. Energy code local amendments.

The following local amendments are made to the International Energy Conservation Code, 2012
Edition, as adopted by the City of Brenham:Fhe-2012 International-Energy-Conservation-Code-is-hereby
amended-as follows:

Sections C101.1 and R101.1 are hereby amended by inserting:
the City of Brenham

Sections C108.4 and R108.4 are deleted in their entirety.

Section C104.5 is hereby amended in its entirety to read: The code official is authorized to accept
reports of approved inspection agencies, provided such agencies satisfy the requirements as to

qualifications and reliability. Ia}in lieu of inspection by City employees, the building official may require a

~—{ comment [3F30]: In addition to IECC C104.5

written certification that a building meets or exceeds minimum requirements, if the certification is: (i)
signed by a code-certified inspector (as defined in V.T.C.A., Health and Safety Code § 388.02) not
employed by the city, and (ii) accompanied by an approved inspection checklist, properly completed,
signed and dated by the inspector. If the fees of the code-certified inspector are paid by the City, the
amount shall be added to the building permit fees otherwise payable. With approval from the building
official, a permittee may pay such fees directly to an independent inspection firm. Only code-certified
inspectors or_inspectors as approved by the currently adopted edition of the IECC may perform
inspections and enforce this code in the City. A copy of all approved inspections, rough-in and final shall
be provided to the city prior to final inspections being requested.

Secs. 6-67—6-70. Reserved.

Page 43

)




BropharTons-cede-ai-Crdinaneas Page 44



ARTICLE VII. MECHANICAL CODE &

Sec. 6-33171. Adoption of code.

The International Mechanical Code, being particularly the 2012 International Mechanical Code (IMC),
and all revisions thereto, save and except such portions as may hereinafter be amended, of which not
less than two (2) copies have been and are now filed in the offices of the City of Brenham, are hereby
adopted and incorporated as fully as if set forth at length herein, and from the date on which this section
shall take effect, the provisions therein shall be controlling within the area of jurisdiction of the city.

(Ord. of 11-15-84, § 1; Ord. of 7-3-86, § 1(2); Ord. of 9-3-92, § 2; Ord. of 2-1-96, § 5; Ord. of 6-2-05,
§8)

Sec. 6-31171.1. Mechanical code local amendments.

The following local amendments are made to the Internatlonal Mechanlcal Code 2012 Edition, as
adopted by the City of Brenham:
follows

Section 101.1 is hereby amended by inserting: the City of Brenham

Section 106.5 is deleted in its entirety.

Section 108.4 is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows: Persons who shall violate a
provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install,
alter or repair_mechanical work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the
code official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be qguilty of a
misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not more than two thousand dollars ($2,000.00). Each day that a
violation continues shall be deemed a separate offense.

Section 108.5.5 is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows: Upon notice from the code
official that mechanical work is being done contrary to the provisions of this code or in a dangerous or
unsafe manner, such work shall immediately cease. Such notice shall be in writing and shall be given to
the owner of the property, or to the owner’s agent, or to the person doing the work. The notice shall state
the conditions under which work is authorized to resume. Where an emergency exists, the code official
shall not be required to give a written notice prior to stopping the work.

Ga——r-

Add-to-Section M306.3 is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows: Attics containing
appliances shall be provided with an opening and unobstructed passageway large enough to allow
removal of the largest appliance. The passageway shall not be less than 30 inches (762 mm) high and 22
inches (559 mm) wide and not more than 20 feet (6096 mm) in length measured along the centerline of
the passageway from the opening to the appliance. The passageway shall have continuous solid flooring

Page 45



not less than 24 inches (610 mm) wide. A level service space not less than 30 inches (762 mm) deep and
30 inches (762 mm) wide shall be present at the front or service side of the appliance. The clear access
opening dimensions shall be a minimum of 20 inches by 30 inches (508 mm by 762 mm), and large
enough to allow removal of the largest appliance. There must be a permanently-installed stairway, either
fixed or folding, to -serve attic space where appliances or equipment are located. The opening must be at
least 25.5" x 54", and any folding staircase must be rated for at least 350 pounds capacity and at least 20
minutes fire resistance and large enough to remove the largest appliance installed there in.

Exceptions:

1. The passageway and level service space are not required where the appliance is capable of
being serviced and removed through the required opening.

2. Where the passageway is unobstructed and not less than 6 feet (1829 mm) high and 22 inches
(559 mm) wide for its entire length, the passageway shall be not greater than 50 feet (15 250
mm) in length.

Page 46



Secs. 6-72—6-75. Reserved.

ARTICLE VIIl. ONE-ANBDTFPNO-FAMILY-DWELLING RESIDENTIAL CODE

Sec. 6-12176. Adoption of code.

The International Residential Code, being particularly the 2012 International Residential Code (IRC),
and all revisions thereto, save and except such portions as may hereinafter be amended, of which not
less than two (2) copies have been and are now filed in the offices of the City of Brenham, are hereby
adopted and incorporated as fully as if set forth at length herein, and from the date on which this section
shall take effect, the provisions therein shall be controlling within the area of jurisdiction of the city.

(Ord. of 7-3-86, § 1(7); Ord. of 9-3-92, § 7; Ord. of 2-1-96, § 6; Ord. of 6-2-05, § 10)

Sec. 6-76.1. Residential code local amendments.

The following local amendments are made to the Intematlonal ReS|dent|aI Code, 2012 Edltlon as
adopted by the City of Brenham:

All amendments and deletions to the other "International Codes" adopted by this Schedule are also
carried forward and adopted as amendments to or deletions from the International Residential Code,
2012 Edition.

This code does not apply to installation and maintenance of electrical wiring and related
components. See National Electrical Codebelow.

Section R101.1 is hereby amended by inserting: the City of Brenham

Page 47



Table R301.2 (1) is hereby amended in its entirety to read as follows

In-Section-R301.2 insert the following table:

Table R301.2(1). Climatic and Geographical Design Criteria Page 3-3

numbers: 0295C 0300C 0315C 0450C

Ground snow 0 [per figure R301.2(5)] Air freezing index: 50 BF
load: days
Wind speed 100 (3-second gust) [per figure Mean annual 68° F
(mph): R301.2(4)A temperature:
Seismic design A [per figure R301.2(2)] Subject to damage from Negligible
category: weathering:[per figure
R301.2(3)

Winter design 32° F [appendix D of the IPC, Houston] |Frost line: [per figure 5"
temperature: [per figure R302.2(1)] Local Data if more |R301.2(8)]

accurate
Ice shield Not required Termite: [per figure Very
underlayment: R301.2(6) heavy
Flood hazards: Map effective date: August 16, 2011 Decay: Mod. to

Community Number 480648 Panel severe

Inr-Section P2603.56.1 is hereby amended in its entirety to read as followsinsert: Building sewers

that connect to private sewage disposal systems shall be a not less than twelve (12) inches below

finished grade at the point of septic tank connection. Building sewers shall be not less than twelve

(12) inches below grade.12 inches forminimum-depth cover fora sewerline:

In-Section P3103.1 is hereby amended in its entirety to read as followsinsert: Open vent pipes

that extend through a roof shall be terminated not less than twelve (12) inches above the roof or

twelve (12) inches above the anticipated snow accumulation, whichever is greater, except that

Page 48




where a roof is to be used for any purpose other than weather protection, the vent extension shall

be run not less than 7 feet above the roof. 12-inchesfora-minimum-heightabeve-therooflinefora

SSecs. 6-77—6-80. Reserved.

Page 49



ARTICLE IX. BNHFORM-CODEFOR BUHLDING-CONSERVATONEXISTING BUILDING
CODE

Sec. 6-13181. Adoption of code.

The International Existing Building Code, being patrticularly the 2012 International Existing Building
Code (IEBQ), and all revisions thereto, save and except such portions as may hereinafter be amended, of
which not less than two (2) copies have been and are now filed in the offices of the City of Brenham, are
hereby adopted and incorporated as fully as if set forth at length herein, and from the date on which this
section shall take effect, the provisions therein shall be controlling within the area of jurisdiction of the city.

(Ord. of 7-3-86, 8 1(7); Ord. of 9-3-92, § 7; Ord. of 2-1-96, § 6; Ord. of 6-2-05, § 10)

Sec. 6-13281.2. Existing building code local amendments.

The following local amendments are made to the International Existing Building Code, 2012 Edition,
as adopted by the City of Brenham:

Section 101.1 is hereby amended by inserting: the City of Brenham

Section 1401.2 is hereby amended by inserting: [Effective date of ordinance adopting Existing

Building Code

Secs. 6-82—6-85. Reserved.

Page 50



Chester B ULDRICE AR SR UCTLURES
ARHELEESWAMMINGPOOLS

ARTICLE X. SWIMMING POOLS ¥

Sec. 6-14286. Definition.

A swimming pool within the meaning of this section shall be any depression in the ground, either
temporary or permanent, or a container of water, either temporary or permanent, and either above or
below the ground which contains water of more than twenty-four (24) inches in depth and which is used
primarily for the purpose of bathing or swimming.

{Ord—of-5-16-91-8-1)

Sec. 6-14387. Installation of new pools and compliance of existing pools.

(a) It shall be unlawful for any person to construct, install or enlarge a swimming pool in the city limits
not enclosed in a permanent building with self-closing, self-latching doors, except in accordance with
the following regulations.

(b) It shall be unlawful for any person who owns an indoor swimming pool within the city limits on the
effective date hereof to maintain such swimming pool without self-closing, self-latching doors leading
directly to the pool area after September 1, 1991.

(c) It shall be unlawful for any person who owns an outdoor swimming pool within the city limits on the
effective date hereof to maintain such swimming pool without fences as provided in section 6-146
after September 1, 1991.

{Ord—of5-16-91-5-2)

Sec. 6-14488. Permit.

It shall be unlawful for any person to construct, install, enlarge or alter any private swimming pool
unless a building permit has first been obtained from the building inspector. The permit fee shall be paid
per fee schedule. Application shall be on forms provided by the building inspector and shall be
accompanied by plans drawn to scale showing the following:

(1) Pool dimensions and volume of water in gallons;

BrophoraTons-cede-ai-Crdinaneas Page 51



Chaster e BLHLDIRICE A D SR LICTUIRES
ARHELEXSWHMMING-POOLS

(2) Location and type of waste disposal system;

(3) Location of pool on lot, distance from lot lines and distance from structure;
(4) Fencing and landscape plan, or a combination thereof; and

(5) Specifications on gate latching.

{Ord—of-5-16-91-8-3)

Sec. 6-14589. Construction requirements.

@

(b)

©

(d)

All pools located, erected, enlarged, or constructed within the City of Brenham shall conform to the
following requirements:

(1) A minimum five-foot rear and side yard is required;

(2) A minimum twenty-five-foot front yard and a fifteen-foot side yard on corner lots is required, or
pools must be located behind the established building lines of the principle structure located on
the lot, whichever distance is greater;

(3) Pools must be a minimum of five (5) feet from any structure to allow access for emergency
rescue operations; and

(4) All measurements are taken from the outermost edge of the pool coping.

Any connection to the city's sewer system shall include a suitable gap or backflow prevention device
to prevent contamination of the pool by the sewer.

Gaseous chlorination system shall not be used as a disinfection method for pool waters. The building
inspector shall recommend a proper disinfectant.

Any connection to the city's potable water system shall be protected by a suitable air gap or
approved backflow prevention device.

7 7 g v 7 v

Sec. 6-14690. Fence.

@

(b)

©

Pools within the scope of this section or not enclosed within a permanent building shall be
completely enclosed by a fence of sufficient strength to prevent access to the pool and shall not be
less than four (4) feet in height, so constructed as not to have voids, holes or openings larger than
four (4) inches in one dimension. Gates or doors shall be equipped with a self-closing and self-
latching childproof device for keeping the gate or door securely closed at all times when not in actual
use. Such latch shall be installed at a minimum height of four (4) feet or the top of the fence. Gates
or doors may be disabled from use to the satisfaction of the city manager or his designee in lieu of a
self-closing and self-latching device. The location of fencing required shall be subject to all other
applicable ordinances. No fence shall be located, erected, constructed or maintained closer than
three (3) feet to a pool. The wall of the house or building faced to a pool may be incorporated as a
portion of such fence.

Aboveground pools with self-provided fencing to prevent unguarded entry will be allowed without
separate additional fencing, providing the self-provided fence is of four-foot required height and
design as heretofore specified.

Permanent access from grade to aboveground pools having stationary ladders, stairs or ramps shall
have not less than equal safeguard fencing and gates.

DronhartomsCodealOrdinanees Page 52



Sec. 6-14791. Pool covers.

Pools which have a maximum depth of four (4) feet or less may be covered in lieu of a fence to
comply with these requirements.

(Ord--of-5-16-91,86)

Sec. 6-14892. Other regulations.

No pool shall be so operated or maintained as to create a nuisance, a hazard, an eyesore or
otherwise to result in a substantial adverse effect on neighboring properties, or to be in any other way
detrimental to public health, safety and welfare.

(Ord. of 5-16-91, § 7)

Sec. 6-93149. Maintenance.

A swimming pool or swimming pools shall be disinfected and maintained in a sanitary manner. The
health inspector may inspect or cause to be inspected each private swimming pool maintained in the city.

{Ord—of5-16-91.-5-8)

Sec. 6-15094. Pool safety equipment.

Each pool shall maintain at least one floating throw-ring and rope and/or one rescue pole per pool.
Such equipment shall be maintained in good working order.

(Ord-of5-16-91.§9)
Sec. 6-15195. Penalty.
Any person, firm or corporation violating any provision of this article shall be fined not less than one

dollar ($1.00) nor more than five hundred dollars ($500.00) for each offense, and a separate offense shall
be deemed committed on each day during or on which a violation occurs or continues.

v 7 g v

Page 53



	ARTICLE I. IN GENERAL
	Secs. 6-16—6-25. Reserved.
	ARTICLE II. ELECTRICALBUILDING CODE
	ARTICLE IIVI. GAS
	ARTICLE IV. HOUSINGINTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE
	ARTICLE VII. RESERVED ENERGY CODE [2]
	ARTICLE VII. MECHANICAL CODE [3]
	ARTICLE IX. UNIFORM CODE FOR BUILDING CONSERVATIONEXISTING BUILDING CODE
	ARTICLE X. SWIMMING POOLS [4]

