
 
 

NOTICE OF A REGULAR MEETING 
THE BRENHAM CITY COUNCIL 

THURSDAY, OCTOBER 20, 2016 AT 1:00 P.M. 
SECOND FLOOR CITY HALL 

COUNCIL CHAMBERS 
200 W. VULCAN 

BRENHAM, TEXAS 
 
 

1. Call Meeting to Order 
 
2. Invocation and Pledges to the US and Texas Flags – Councilmember Herring 
 
3. Proclamation 

 Texas Chamber of Commerce Week    Page 1 
 
4. Citizens Comments 
 
 
WORK SESSION 
 
5. Discussion and Presentation on Street Improvement Program  Pages 2-3 
 
6. Discussion and Presentation on the Federal Emergency Management Agency’s 

(FEMA’s) Mitigation Project from the May 2016 Flood Event  Page 4 
 
 
REGULAR SESSION 
 
7. Discuss and Possibly Act Upon Resolution No. R-16-029 Authorizing the Execution 

of an Agreement with TxDOT for the Temporary Closure of State Right of Way in 
Connection with the 2016 Christmas Stroll and Lighted Parade to be Held on 
Saturday, December 3, 2016      Pages 5-17 

 
 
 
  



8. Discuss and Possibly Act Upon an Ordinance on Its First Reading Providing for 
Annually Repeating Updated Service Credits and an Increase in Retirement 
Annuities in the Texas Municipal Retirement System Effective January 1, 2017 

           Pages 18-27 
9. Discuss and Possibly Act Upon Resolution No. R-16-030 Expressing Official Intent 

to Reimburse Certain Costs Related to the Water Treatment Plant Rehabilitation 
and Protective Coatings Project      Pages 28-32 

 
10. Discuss and Possibly Act Upon Bid No. 3900.042/050 Related to the 2016 Water 

Treatment Plant Protective Coatings Project and Authorize the Mayor to Execute 
Any Necessary Documentation      Pages 33-48 

 
11. Discuss and Possibly Act Upon the Approval of a Purchase Related to the 

Emergency Repairs to the Raw Water Intake Pump No. 1 at the Lake Somerville 
Pump Station and Authorize the Mayor to Execute Any Necessary Documentation 

           Pages 49-51 
12. Discuss and Possibly Act Upon a Request from the Washington County Appraisal 

District for Disaster Reappraisal of Properties Located Within the Declared 
Disaster Area in the City Resulting from the May 2016 Flood Event, as Authorized 
by Section 23.02 of the Texas Tax Code, and Authorize the Mayor to Execute Any 
Necessary Documentation       Pages 52-56 

 
13. Administrative/Elected Officials Report 
 

 Parks and Recreation Update 
 
 
Administrative/Elected Officials Reports:  Reports from City Officials or City staff regarding items of community interest, 
including expression of thanks, congratulations or condolences; information regarding holiday schedules; honorary or salutary 
recognitions of public officials, public employees or other citizens; reminders about upcoming events organized or sponsored by 
the City; information regarding social, ceremonial, or community events organized or sponsored by a non-City entity that is 
scheduled to be attended by City officials or employees; and announcements involving imminent threats to the public health and 
safety of people in the City that have arisen after the posting of the agenda. 

 
Adjourn 
 
 
Executive Sessions: The City Council for the City of Brenham reserves the right to convene into executive session at any time 
during the course of this meeting to discuss any of the matters listed, as authorized by Texas Government Code, Chapter 551, 
including but not limited to §551.071 – Consultation with Attorney, §551.072 – Real Property, §551.073 – Prospective Gifts, 
§551.074 - Personnel Matters, §551.076 – Security Devices, §551.086 -  Utility Competitive Matters, and §551.087 – Economic 
Development Negotiation 

 
 
 
 

  



CERTIFICATION 
 

I certify that a copy of the October 20, 2016 agenda of items to be considered by the City of Brenham 
City Council was posted to the City Hall bulletin board at 200 W. Vulcan, Brenham, Texas on October 
17, 2016 at 12:15 PM. 
 
 
 

Kacey A. Weiss 
Deputy City Secretary 
 
 
 
 
Disability Access Statement:  This meeting is wheelchair accessible.  The accessible entrance is located at the Vulcan Street 
entrance to the City Administration Building.  Accessible parking spaces are located adjoining the entrance.  Auxiliary aids and 
services are available upon request (interpreters for the deaf must be requested twenty-four (24) hours before the meeting) by 
calling (979) 337-7567 for assistance. 
 
 
 
 
I certify that the attached notice and agenda of items to be considered by the City Council was removed by me from 
the City Hall bulletin board on the ________ day of ___________________, 2016 at __________ AM PM. 
 
___________________________________ ___________________________________ 
Signature Title 
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AGENDA ITEM 5 

 
DATE OF MEETING: October 20, 2016 
 
DEPT. OF ORIGIN: Public Works 

DATE SUBMITTED: October 14, 2016 
 
SUBMITTED BY: Dane Rau 

MEETING TYPE:                                      CLASSIFICATION:                                        ORDINANCE: 
 
    REGULAR   PUBLIC HEARING   1ST READING 
 
   SPECIAL   CONSENT   2ND READING 
 
   EXECUTIVE SESSION   REGULAR   RESOLUTION 
 
    WORK SESSION 
 
AGENDA ITEM DESCRIPTION:  Discussion and Presentation on Street Improvement Program 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT:  During the past budget process City Council dedicated $225,000/yr. from the sale 
of the Chappell Hill Property and authorized another $135,000 to remain in the operating budget for Street 
Reconstruction.  This will allow the Street Department a total of $360,000/yr. to bring “POOR” streets into the 
“Satisfactory” stage relating to the street inventory.  In the past few years we were only allowed reconstruction 
money at the $135,000 mark.  The last time the street inventory was conducted was 2013 when at this time it was 
determined that 20% of the 85 miles of streets were in the “POOR” category with 35% in the “Fair” category.   
 
With this additional money staff has taken the approach to tackle the 20% of the “POOR” streets.  Out of the 85 
miles, 22.5 miles are targeted with a total value of 3.4 million dollars.  Roughly it takes $150,000 per mile to 
reconstruct in-house.  The Street Dept. is very excited about the additional money and staff has outlined the 
sections of roadways that will be targeted for reconstruction utilizing the 1.46 million dollars over a 4 year period.  
By utilizing this money it will eliminate 9.4 miles of these 22.5 miles of streets and bring them from the “POOR” 
category to “Satisfactory” rating.   
 
We will begin on reconstruction projects very soon and continue into the next year with the streets identified in 
2017.  We want council to realize that with the current funding this will help improve 3 times the number of 
roadways that we have been accustom to in the past few years, but if this pace remains without some sort of 
additional funding, it will take 9.5 years to tackle the 22.5 miles of “POOR” roadways identified.  The current 
funding allows 2.3 miles per year to be reconstructed.   
 
We are confident that our streets staff will be able to handle this additional street work and after the first year and 
with the new equipment we will be able to report back to council how the additional work load was handled.  The 
streets listed in the report can be interchanged but it is also important that we stick to a schedule that improves 
roadways equally among the wards.  It is also important that we stick to our initial plan of reconstructing sections 
of roadways where utilities were recently upgraded.   
 
If you have any questions related to the 4 year plan please let me know.       
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STAFF ANALYSIS (For Ordinances or Regular Agenda Items): 

A. PROS:   

B. CONS:   
ALTERNATIVES (In Suggested Order of Staff Preference):  
 
ATTACHMENTS: Information will be distributed to Mayor and City Council members and will be on file for 
review in the City Secretary’s office. 
 
FUNDING SOURCE (Where Applicable):   
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: No action required – discussion only. 
 
APPROVALS: Terry K. Roberts 
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AGENDA ITEM 6 

 
DATE OF MEETING: October 20, 2016 
 
DEPT. OF ORIGIN: Engineering Department 

DATE SUBMITTED:  October 14, 2016 
 
SUBMITTED BY: Lori Lakatos 

MEETING TYPE:                                      CLASSIFICATION:                                        ORDINANCE: 
 
   REGULAR   PUBLIC HEARING   1ST READING 
 
   SPECIAL   CONSENT   2ND READING 
 
   EXECUTIVE SESSION                         REGULAR   RESOLUTION 
 
    WORK SESSION 
 
AGENDA ITEM DESCRIPTION: Discussion and Presentation on the Federal Emergency Management 
Agency’s (FEMA’s) Mitigation Project from the May 2016 Flood Event 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: During the May 2016 Flood Event multiple sites were damaged throughout the 
City.  FEMA declared Washington County as part of DR-4272 for public assistance.  As part of the recovery 
relief FEMA provides hazard mitigation, should the projects meet the benefit cost analysis and will help reduce 
the risk of these types of damages occurring in the future.  Staff would like some guidance for mitigation options 
on select sites.  
 
STAFF ANALYSIS (For Ordinances or Regular Agenda Items): 
 

A. PROS: 
B. CONS: 

 

ALTERNATIVES (In Suggested Order of Staff Preference): N/A 
 
ATTACHMENTS:  Information will be distributed to Mayor and City Council members and will be on file for 
review in the City Secretary’s office.  
 
FUNDING SOURCE (Where Applicable):  
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: No action required – discussion only. 
 
APPROVALS: Terry K. Roberts 
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AGENDA ITEM 7 

 
DATE OF MEETING: October 20, 2016 
 
DEPT. OF ORIGIN: Community Services 

DATE SUBMITTED: October 6, 2016 
 
SUBMITTED BY: Crystal Locke 

MEETING TYPE:                                      CLASSIFICATION:                                        ORDINANCE: 
 
    REGULAR   PUBLIC HEARING   1ST READING 
 
   SPECIAL   CONSENT   2ND READING 
 
   EXECUTIVE SESSION   REGULAR   RESOLUTION 
 
    WORK SESSION 
 
AGENDA ITEM DESCRIPTION: Discuss and Possibly Act Upon Resolution No. R-16-029 Authorizing the 
Execution of an Agreement with TxDOT for the Temporary Closure of State Right of Way in Connection with 
the 2016 Christmas Stroll and Lighted Parade to be Held on Saturday, December 3, 2016 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT:  The 2016 Christmas Stroll and Lighted Parade is hosted by the City of Brenham.  
Our goal is to create a family friendly holiday environment and attract people to the downtown area.  This year’s 
stroll will be held the first weekend in December, 2-3, 2016. Friday from 5:00pm until 9:00pm and Saturday from 
8:00am until 9:00pm. Main Street and Alamo Street will be closed between Market Street and Austin Street from 
5:00pm until 9:00pm on Friday and 4:00pm until 9:00pm on Saturday. There will be live entertainment, a lighted 
parade, Holiday hayride, horse-drawn carriage rides, kids’ activities, and more. Due to an agreement with TxDOT 
closures over four hours need approval, while closures four hours and under do not need approval. 
 
STAFF ANALYSIS (For Ordinances or Regular Agenda Items): 
A. PROS:         
 
B. CONS:         
ALTERNATIVES (In Suggested Order of Staff Preference):       
 
ATTACHMENTS: (1) Resolution No. R-16-029; (2) Application for Event Permit (With Street Closures); and 
(3) Agreement with TxDOT 
 
FUNDING SOURCE (Where Applicable):       
RECOMMENDED ACTION: Approve Resolution No. R-16-029 authorizing the execution of an agreement 
with TxDOT for the temporary closure of state right of way in connection with the 2016 Christmas Stroll and 
Lighted Parade to be held on Saturday, December 3, 2016 
 
APPROVALS: Terry K. Roberts 
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RESOLUTION NO. R-16-029 
 
 
THE STATE OF TEXAS 
 
COUNTY OF WASHINGTON 
 
 

WHEREAS, the Texas Department of Transportation operates certain state highways 
within the City limits of the City of Brenham; 

 
WHEREAS, the City of Brenham has received requests for street closings along state 

highways within the City of Brenham; 
 
WHEREAS, the Texas Department of Transportation and the City of Brenham have 

agreed to certain terms and conditions regarding the closing of a portion of the state highway 
within the City limits for the purpose of said closings; 

 
WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Brenham has considered the foregoing and 

the aforesaid contract and have agreed to be bound by the provisions thereof for the purpose of 
closing said streets for the 2016 Christmas Stroll and Lighted Parade. 

 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 

CITY OF BRENHAM, TEXAS: 
 
The Mayor of Brenham, acting on behalf of the City Council of the City of Brenham is 

hereby authorized to execute the attached agreement with the Texas Department of 
Transportation in connection with the closure of state highways within the City of Brenham 
associated with the 2016 Christmas Stroll and Lighted Parade.  This resolution is effective upon 
its adoption. 
 

Adopted this the 20th day of October, 2016 
 
 
 

      ________________________________ 
       Milton Y. Tate, Jr., 
       Mayor 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
 
____________________________________  
Jeana Bellinger, TRMC 
City Secretary 
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AGENDA ITEM 8 

 
DATE OF MEETING: October 20, 2016 
 
DEPT. OF ORIGIN:  Finance 

DATE SUBMITTED: October 14, 2016 
 
SUBMITTED BY:  Carolyn D. Miller 

MEETING TYPE:                                      CLASSIFICATION:                                        ORDINANCE: 
 
    REGULAR   PUBLIC HEARING   1ST READING 
 
   SPECIAL   CONSENT   2ND READING 
 
   EXECUTIVE SESSION   REGULAR   RESOLUTION 
 
    WORK SESSION 
 
AGENDA ITEM DESCRIPTION: Discuss and Possibly Act Upon an Ordinance on Its First Reading Providing 
for Annually Repeating Updated Service Credits and an Increase in Retirement Annuities in the Texas Municipal 
Retirement System effective January 1, 2017  
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT:  For many years, City Council has approved, on an annual basis, an ordinance 
providing for updated service credit (USC) and an increase in retirement annuities of 70% of the CPI as provided 
through the Texas Municipal Retirement System.  In order to make any changes in the City’s plan provisions, an 
ordinance must be approved by Council.  The applicable TMRS ordinance for 2017 is presented for discussion 
and approval. 
 
In the FY17 budget workshops, we discussed transitioning to “best business practices” to advance fund the 
promised benefit to City employees during their working years which is also known as “generational equity”.  
The ordinance prepared by TMRS allows for updated service credits on an annually repeating basis while the 
increases in retirement annuities are for one year.  The change in the City’s contribution rate is shown on the 
TMRS Plan Change Study.  In the FY17 budget, we included the Plan 2 rate of 9.62%.      
 
STAFF ANALYSIS (For Ordinances or Regular Agenda Items): 

A. PROS: Current City of Brenham retirees will receive an annuity increase effective January 1, 2017 and future 
retirees will most likely have an enhanced retirement annuity because of Updated Service Credits. 

B. CONS: Enhancements result in an increased unfunded actuarial liability. 
 
ALTERNATIVES (In Suggested Order of Staff Preference):  
 
ATTACHMENTS: (1) TMRS Ordinance; (2) Letter from Eric Davis; and (3) TMRS Plan Change Study  
 
FUNDING SOURCE (Where Applicable): Funds are available in the FY16-17 Budget 
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RECOMMENDED ACTION: Approve an Ordinance on its first reading providing for annually repeating 
updated service credits and an increase in retirement annuities in the Texas Municipal Retirement System 
effective January 1, 2017 
 
APPROVALS: Terry K. Roberts 
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 TMRS-USC T R/ CPI AD Hoc 
                                                  ORDINANCE NO. ________ 

TEXAS MUNICIPAL RETIREMENT SYSTEM 
 

AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING AND ALLOWING, UNDER THE ACT 
GOVERNING THE TEXAS MUNICIPAL RETIREMENT SYSTEM, "UPDATED 
SERVICE CREDITS" IN SAID SYSTEM ON AN ANNUAL BASIS FOR 
SERVICE PERFORMED BY QUALIFYING MEMBERS OF SUCH SYSTEM 
WHO AT THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THE ALLOWANCE ARE MEMBERS OF 
THE CITY OF BRENHAM; PROVIDING FOR INCREASED PRIOR AND 
CURRENT SERVICE ANNUITIES FOR RETIREES AND BENEFICIARIES OF 
DECEASED RETIREES OF THE CITY;  AND ESTABLISHING AN EFFECTIVE 
DATE FOR THE ORDINANCE. 

 
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF BRENHAM, TEXAS: 
 
Authorization of Updated Service Credits. 
 
 (a) On the terms and conditions set out in Sections 853.401 through 853.404 of 
Subtitle G of Title 8, Government Code, as amended, (hereinafter referred to as the "TMRS 
Act"), each member of the Texas Municipal Retirement System (hereinafter referred to as the 
"System") who has current service credit or prior service credit in the System in force and effect 
on the 1st day of January of the calendar year preceding such allowance, by reason of service 
in the employment of the City (hereinafter called the "City") and on such date had at least  36 
months of credited service with the System, shall be and is hereby allowed" Updated Service 
Credit" (as that term is defined in subsection (d) of Section 853.402 of the TMRS Act). 
 
 (b) On the terms and conditions set out in Section 853.601 of the TMRS Act, any 
member of the System who is eligible for Updated Service Credits on the basis of service with 
this City, who has unforfeited credit for prior service and/or current service with another 
participating municipality or municipalities by reason of previous service, and was a contributing 
member on the 1st day of January of the calendar year preceding such allowance shall be 
credited with Updated Service Credits pursuant to, calculated in accordance with, and subject to 
adjustment as set forth in said Section 853.601, both as to the initial grant thereunder and all 
future grants under this ordinance. 
 
 (c) The Updated Service Credit hereby allowed and provided for shall be 100% of 
the "base Updated Service Credit" of the member (calculated as provided in subsection (c) of 
Section 853.402 of the TMRS Act).   
 
 (d) Each Updated Service Credit allowed hereunder shall replace any Updated 
Service Credit, prior service credit, special prior service credit, or antecedent service credit 
previously authorized for part of the same service. 
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Page 2. 
 
 
 
 (e) The initial allowance of Updated Service Credit hereunder shall be effective on 
January 1, 2017, subject to approval by the Board of Trustees of the System.  An allowance 
shall be made hereunder on January 1 of each subsequent year until this ordinance ceases to 
be in effect under subsection (e) of Section 853.404 of the TMRS Act, provided that, as to such 
subsequent year, the actuary for the System has made the determination set forth in subsection 
(d) of Section 853.404 of the TMRS Act. 
 
 (f) In accordance with the provisions of subsection (d) of Section 853.401 of the 
TMRS Act, the deposits required to be made to the System by employees of the several 
participating departments on account of current service shall be calculated from and after the 
effective date of this ordinance on the full amount of such person's compensation as an 
employee of the City. 
 
Increase in Retirement Annuities. 
  

(a) On the terms and conditions set out in Section 854.203 of Subtitle G of Title 8, 
Government Code, as amended (hereinafter referred to as the "TMRS Act"), the City hereby 
elects to allow and to provide for payment of the increases below stated in monthly benefits 
payable by the System to retired employees and to beneficiaries of deceased employees of the 
City under current service annuities and prior service annuities arising from service by such 
employees to the City.  An annuity increased under this section replaces any annuity or 
increased annuity previously granted to the same person. 
 
 (b) The amount of the annuity increase under this section is computed as the sum of 
the prior service and current service annuities on the effective date of retirement of the person 
on whose service the annuities are based, multiplied by 70% of the percentage change in 
Consumer Price Index for All Urban Consumers, from December of the year immediately 
preceding the effective date of the person's retirement to the December that is 13 months 
before the effective date of the increase under this Section. 
 
 (c) An increase in an annuity that was reduced because of an option selection is 
reducible in the same proportion and in the same manner that the original annuity was reduced. 
 
 (d) If a computation hereunder does not result in an increase in the amount of an 
annuity, the amount of the annuity will not be changed hereunder. 
 
 (e) The amount by which an increase under this Section exceeds all previously 
granted increases to an annuitant is an obligation of the City and of its account in the Benefit 
Accumulation Fund of the System. 
 
Effective Date. Subject to approval by the Board of Trustees of the System, this 
ordinance shall be and become effective on the 1st day of January 2017. 
 
 Passed and approved this the ____ day of ___________________, 20__. 
 
 
ATTEST:  APPROVED: 
 
 
       
 City Secretary or Clerk   Mayor 
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AGENDA ITEM 9 

 
DATE OF MEETING:  October 20, 2016 
 
DEPT. OF ORIGIN:  Finance 

DATE SUBMITTED:  October 14, 2016 
 
SUBMITTED BY:  Carolyn D. Miller 

MEETING TYPE:                                      CLASSIFICATION:                                        ORDINANCE: 
 
    REGULAR   PUBLIC HEARING   1ST READING 
 
   SPECIAL   CONSENT   2ND READING 
 
   EXECUTIVE SESSION   REGULAR   RESOLUTION 
 
    WORK SESSION 
 
AGENDA ITEM DESCRIPTION:  Discuss and Possibly Act Upon Resolution No. R-16-030 Expressing 
Official Intent to Reimburse Certain Costs Related to the Water Treatment Plant Rehabilitation and Protective 
Coatings Project 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT:  During the FY17 Budget Workshops, capital projects requiring the issuance of 
Certificates of Obligation were discussed along with the timing of the related debt issuances. Included in this 
discussion was the Water Treatment Plant Rehabilitation and Protective Coatings Project (Raw Water Tank & 
Clarifier Rehab) for $677,000. This project was slated to require debt funding to be obtained in calendar year 
2017, utilizing a portion of the $10 million bank qualified capacity for 2017. The Debt Projects Recap page is 
included for your information. The next agenda item will present the bids obtained by the City for a portion of this 
total project. The City would like to begin work in the next 6 to 8 weeks on these planned improvements. In order 
to issue purchase orders for this project, the Council must approve the Reimbursement Resolution to declare 
reimbursement of certain costs related to these capital expenditures from the issuance of Certificates of Obligation 
to be repaid thru Water rates. 
 
STAFF ANALYSIS (For Ordinances or Regular Agenda Items): 
A. PROS:   Provide resources necessary to award bids for the Water Treatment Plant Rehabilitation and 
Protective Coatings Project and provide funding for this capital project.   
 
B. CONS:   Funding is not adequate to award bids for the Water Treatment Plant Rehabilitation and Protective 
Coatings Project and bids expire. 
 
ALTERNATIVES (In Suggested Order of Staff Preference):  
 
ATTACHMENTS:  (1) Resolution No. R-16-030; and (2) Debt Projects Recap Schedule 
 
FUNDING SOURCE (Where Applicable):  2017/2018 Certificates of Obligation 
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RECOMMENDED ACTION:  Approve Resolution No. R-16-030 expressing official intent to reimburse certain 
costs related to the water treatment plant rehabilitation and protective coatings project 
 
APPROVALS:  Terry K. Roberts 
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RESOLUTION NO. R-16-030 
 
A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF BRENHAM, TEXAS EXPRESSING 
OFFICIAL INTENT TO REIMBURSE CERTAIN COSTS RELATED TO 
THE WATER TREATMENT PLANT REHAB AND PROTECTIVE 
COATINGS PROJECT 
 

WHEREAS, the City of Brenham, Texas (the "City") is a political subdivision of the 
State of Texas; and 

 
WHEREAS, the City expects to pay, or have paid on its behalf, expenditures in 

connection with the project on Exhibit "A" hereto (the "Project") prior to the issuance of tax-
exempt obligations for which a prior expression of intent to finance or refinance is required by 
Federal or state law (collectively and individually, the “Obligations”) to finance the Project; and 

 
WHEREAS, the City finds, considers, and declares that the reimbursement for the 

payment of such expenditures will be appropriate and consistent with the lawful objectives of the 
City and, as such, chooses to declare its intention to reimburse itself for such payments at such 
time as it issues Obligations to finance the Project; 

 
THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

BRENHAM, TEXAS THAT:   
 

Section 1: The City reasonably expects to incur debt, as one or more series of 
Obligations, with an aggregate maximum principal amount equal to 
$677,000 for the purpose of paying the costs of the Project. 

 
Section 2: All costs to be reimbursed pursuant hereto will be capital expenditures.  No 

Obligations will be issued by the City in furtherance of this Resolution after 
a date which is later than 18 months after the later of (1) the date the 
expenditures are paid or (2) the date on which the property, with respect to 
which such expenditures were made, is placed in service. 

 
Section 3: The foregoing notwithstanding, no Obligation will be issued pursuant to this 

Resolution more than three years after the date any expenditure which is to 
be reimbursed is paid. 

 
Section 4: This Resolution shall be effective immediately upon its passage and 

approval.  
 
 

PASSED AND APPROVED this _____ day of _________________, 2016. 
 
 
 ____________________________ 
 Milton Y. Tate, Jr., Mayor 
 
______________________________ 
Jeana Bellinger, TRMC, City Secretary  
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Exhibit "A" 
 
 
 

Project Description 
 
The rehabilitation and maintenance of the City Water Treatment Plant and also including any 
legal, engineering, fiscal and other fees relating thereto. 
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AGENDA ITEM 10 

 
DATE OF MEETING: October 20, 2016 
 
DEPT. OF ORIGIN:  Public Utilities 

DATE SUBMITTED: October 13, 2016 
 
SUBMITTED BY:  Lowell Ogle 

MEETING TYPE:                                      CLASSIFICATION:                                        ORDINANCE: 
 
   REGULAR   PUBLIC HEARING   1ST READING 
 
   SPECIAL   CONSENT   2ND READING 
 
   EXECUTIVE SESSION   REGULAR   RESOLUTION 
 
    WORK SESSION 
 
AGENDA ITEM DESCRIPTION: Discuss and Possibly Act Upon Bid No. 3900.042/050 Related to the 2016 
Water Treatment Plant Protective Coatings Project and Authorize the Mayor to Execute Any Necessary 
Documentation 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: On September 28, 2016 bids were opened by O’Malley Strand Associates, Inc. and 
City of Brenham staff for the 2016 Water Treatment Plant Protective Coatings project.   

Six bids were received for this project.   The low bidder, Hydro Concrete Tank Solutions of TX, LLC, is qualified 
and experienced in this type of work and has been recommended by O’Malley Strand.  The bid plus all of the 
Additive Alternate bids came in at $357,400.00.   

Planned improvements for the project consists of coating/recoating certain facilities at the City’s Water Treatment 
Plant and include some minor repairs.  All items in and on the clarifiers are to be coated with the exception of the 
floor and a portion of the interior walls. This project would also include the two concrete clearwells, splitter box, 
and some other miscellaneous structures.  

We plan to issue certificates of obligation to fund this project.   
 

 Hydro Concrete 
Wylie, TX 

CFG Ind. 
Spring, TX 

Nations Industrial Svcs 
Pattison, TX 

Gulf State Protective 
Coatings 

LaPorte, TX 

JNA Painting & 
Contracting 

Baltimore,  MD 

E.J.Chris 
Contracting 

Live Oak, TX 
Total Base Bid $287,200 $335,500 $341,000 $365,420 $390,500 $443,150 

Add. Alt. No. 1 36,000 8,500 8,000 8,500 27,000 No Bid 

Add Alt No. 2 9,000 20,000 15,000 8,500 27,000 No Bid 

Add Alt No. 3 9,000 15,000 8,000 8,500 40,000 No Bid 

Add Alt No. 4 5,400 12,000 40,000 47,000 27,000 No Bid 

Add Alt No. 5 5,400 12,000 75,000 98,000 27,000 No Bid 

Add Alt No. 6 1,800 7,500 15,000 10,000 30,000 No Bid 

Add Alt No. 7 3,600 10,000 12,500 7,500 4,000 No Bid 

TOTAL $357,400 $420,500 $514,500 $553,420 $572,500 $443,150 
 
A Letter of Recommendation is attached. 
 
STAFF ANALYSIS (For Ordinances or Regular Agenda Items): 

A. PROS: 
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B. CONS:  
ALTERNATIVES (In Suggested Order of Staff Preference):  
 
ATTACHMENTS: (1) Bid Tabulation; and (2) Recommendation of Award 
 
FUNDING SOURCE (Where Applicable): 2017/2018 Certificates of Obligation 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: Award Bid No. 3900.042/050 to Hydro Concrete Tank Solutions of TX, LLC in 
the amount of $357,400.00 for the 2016 water treatment plant protective coatings project and authorize the Mayor 
to execute any necessary documentation 
 
APPROVALS: Terry K. Roberts 
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AGENDA ITEM 11 

 
DATE OF MEETING:  October 20, 2016 
 
DEPT. OF ORIGIN:  Public Utilities 

DATE SUBMITTED:  October 13, 2016 
 
SUBMITTED BY:  Lowell Ogle, Jr. 

MEETING TYPE:                                      CLASSIFICATION:                                        ORDINANCE: 

   REGULAR   PUBLIC HEARING   1ST READING 

   SPECIAL   CONSENT   2ND READING 

   EXECUTIVE SESSION   REGULAR   RESOLUTION 

    WORK SESSION 

AGENDA ITEM DESCRIPTION:  Discuss and Possibly Act Upon the Approval of a Purchase Related to the 
Emergency Repairs to the Raw Water Intake Pump No. 1 at the Lake Somerville Pump Station and Authorize the 
Mayor to Execute Any Necessary Documentation 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT:  In June 2016, Lake Raw Water Pump 1 required emergency repair.  A quote was 
received from Weisinger Incorporated in the amount of $47,975.00 with alternate costs for a mechanical seal 
($2,400).  At this time, we believed the repairs would not exceed the original estimate and a Purchase Order was 
issued to Weisinger Incorporated in that amount. After the repairs began we decided that the mechanical seal 
would be a beneficial upgrade and authorized that addition. Upon reinstallation the repaired pump would not seat 
properly. We had the wetwell cleaned, however the pump would still not seat.  As a result of the pump not setting 
in place properly, there were some necessary modifications made to the pump.  With the mechanical seal, added 
installation attempts and pump modifications, the final invoice amount was $58,125.00. 
 
STAFF ANALYSIS (For Ordinances or Regular Agenda Items): 

A. PROS:   

B. CONS:  

ALTERNATIVES (In Suggested Order of Staff Preference):  
 
ATTACHMENTS:  (1) Quote dated June 7, 2016; and (2) PO #16-10800 
 
FUNDING SOURCE (Where Applicable):   104-5-163-311.00 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: Approve a purchase from Weisinger Incorporated in the amount of $58,125.00 
related to the emergency repairs to the raw water intake pump no. 1 at the Lake Somerville Pump Station and 
authorize the Mayor to execute any necessary documentation 
 
APPROVALS:  Terry K Roberts 
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AGENDA ITEM 12 

 
DATE OF MEETING: October 20, 2016 
 
DEPT. OF ORIGIN:  Administration 

DATE SUBMITTED: October 4, 2016 
 
SUBMITTED BY:  Terry Roberts 

MEETING TYPE:                                      CLASSIFICATION:                                        ORDINANCE: 
 
    REGULAR   PUBLIC HEARING   1ST READING 
 
   SPECIAL   CONSENT   2ND READING 
 
   EXECUTIVE SESSION   REGULAR   RESOLUTION 
 
    WORK SESSION 
 
AGENDA ITEM DESCRIPTION: Discuss and Possibly Act Upon a Request from the Washington County 
Appraisal District for Disaster Reappraisal of Properties Located Within the Declared Disaster Area in the City 
Resulting from the May 2016 Flood Event, as Authorized by Section 23.02 of the Texas Tax Code, and Authorize 
the Mayor to Execute Any Necessary Documentation 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: The Texas Tax Code allows for the reappraisal of properties located within an area 
declared a natural disaster by the governor; however, the reappraisal process must be authorized by the local 
taxing entities. 
 
The Washington County Appraisal District’s Chief Appraiser, Willy Dilworth, is prepared to perform the 
reappraisal of those properties located within the city limits that sustained major damage in the May 2016 
flooding, if the City Council approves that to done.  He advised that the only properties eligible for reappraisal are 
those seventy or so properties that were included on FEMA’s list of damaged property. 
 
In talking with Judge Brieden and Dr. Jackson, it appears that they will be considering this request also during the 
week of October 17th (the County on the 17th; BISD on the 18th).  Mr. Dilworth explained that if the reappraisals 
are approved by all of the taxing entities, his staff would notify all of the property owners of the steps to take in 
order to have their property, which sustained major damage, reappraised.  It is anticipated the financial impact of 
granting this opportunity for reappraisal will be minimal. 
 
STAFF ANALYSIS (For Ordinances or Regular Agenda Items): 

A. PROS:  

B. CONS:  
 
ALTERNATIVES (In Suggested Order of Staff Preference):  
 
ATTACHMENTS: (1) Cover letter from WCAD to be mailed to all property owners: and (2) Information sheet 
explaining the disaster reappraisal process. 
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FUNDING SOURCE (Where Applicable):  
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: Approve the request from the Washington County Appraisal District for disaster 
reappraisal of properties located within the declared disaster area in the City resulting from the May 2016 flood 
event, as authorized by Section 23.02 of the Texas Tax Code, and authorize the Mayor to execute any necessary 
documentation 
 
APPROVALS: Terry K. Roberts 
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